
Facilitates quick process implementation, and
provides transparency and accountability to
your peer review process. Peer review events
will no longer end up in a “black hole” or lost
on someone’s desk; you will have complete
visibility into the current status and to-do list
for each event. We’ll guide you step-by-step
from identification of an issue, through
development of and individual performance
improvement plan, to addressing quality
concerns.

Peer 
Review
Fast, proficient enrollment of your providers

Convert hard-to-manage paper
policies into an easy-to-manage
automated workflow.

Dynamic Insights

Demonstrate Compliance

Transparent Analytics

Record Timelines

Standardizing the peer review process is
difficult and complex, involving many moving
pieces - documenting policies, ensuring
compliance, and recording the details of each
case.

Our peer review software converts yours
mapped paper policies to an automated
workflow, enabling you to easily maintain a
consistent standard for peer review across all
departments and providers, and ensures that
everyone adheres to defined policies and
procedures.

One click gives you a view of all peer review 

activity for a specific provider, all reviews for 

a specific quality indicator, and all reviews for 

a particular department.

Quickly satisfy auditing requests to The Joint 

Commission’s medical staff standards, such as 

OPPE and FPPE, as well as standards for DNV, 

HFAP, and CIHQ.

Our robust reporting tools provide current

and accurate case status updates to your key 

stakeholders, MEC, and board members.

Develop a comprehensive timeline to describe 

events, attach documents, and examine 

patient and staff data.

Ready to get started? 

http://www.symplr.com/cactus/request-a-demo

