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Expert Scrum Master 
Certification (ESMC™) is the 
next step for Scrum 
practitioners to further 
demonstrate their expertise 
in Scrum methodology. 
 
This course is not just for 
technology experts.  While 
Scrum is popular in the IT 
 

industry and within IT teams, 
it is used effectively across 
disciplines and industries.  
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The Expert Scrum Master 
certification is for those who 
have significant Scrum team 
experience and want to 
develop the necessary skills 
to manage complicated 
Scrum projects and scale 
Scrum in complex projects 
involving large teams, 
programs and portfolios.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

Objectives: 

• To provide advanced skill 
development opportunities 
for those who want to scale 
Scrum to large projects 
involving complex teams, 
programs and portfolios 

 

Prerequisites: 

• Have three years of 
experience managing 
Scrum/Agile projects 

• Be SMC™, SAMC™ and 
SPOC™ certified 

• Submit a 500 word 
summary of two 
Scrum/Agile projects 

• You may also attend a 2-
day ESMC™ classroom 
training provided by a 
SCRUMStudy A.T.P. 

 
 
Fee:   

The cost of the course is 
$249. This fee includes: 
• Certification exam fee 
• PMI approved PDUs 
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