
 
 
 
 
 

FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 
 
 

EnableSoft, Inc. Partners with Basico to Offer  
Robotic Process Automation Software  

 
Orlando, Fla.-based software company expands reach into Europe  

 
Orlando, Fla., March 7, 2017 – EnableSoft Inc., a provider of Robotic Process Automation 
(RPA) software for banks, healthcare and other organizations, announced today that it has 
formed a strategic partnership with Denmark-based Basico to offer Foxtrot RPA® to its clients in 
Denmark and abroad.  
 
Basico is a consulting firm that acts as a collaborative partner to its clients to help their support 
functions within CFO, Finance IT, Legal, GRC, Facility Management and recruitment services to 
the top 1,000 companies in Europe. Its services enable organizations to continue with their day-
to-day operations while searching for a new, permanent employee. Through this partnership, 
Basico will offer RPA software as part of its recruitment and interim services to serve as a virtual 
employee, which helps its clients eliminate manual processes and increase productivity.  
 
“Because we work closely with many different companies, we noticed a growing need for 
automating business processes to increase efficiency,” said Poul Lindorf, Manager at Basico. 
“EnableSoft offers an intuitive RPA software solution that will enable us to meet this need. In 
addition to the market possibilities in Scandinavia, we both share the same goals and basic 
values, which will only strengthen our relationship as we venture down a new path.”   
 
EnableSoft’s Foxtrot RPA enables organizations to increase productivity by automating 
mundane, rules-based processes and acting as an application program interface (API) to 
reduce operational costs. Foxtrot RPA can be easily installed to perform data automation tasks 
in ExcelTM, WindowsTM, web and other legacy applications without coding or programming. An 
organization’s employees are then freed to focus on more customer-facing activities.  
 
“There is a huge shift in the market as more companies are moving from outsourcing to 
automation,” said Richard Milam, CEO of EnableSoft. “This shift has enabled us to connect with 
companies like Basico to expand our reach into other countries that have a need to remove 
manual processes. We’ve worked for more than 20 years to perfect our software, and we’re 
thrilled to have a partner whose basic values and goals align with ours.” 
 
About Basico 
Basico is a Denmark-based management and consulting company that provides interim and 
project assistance in the areas of Chief Financial Officer services, legal, finance IT and 
governance, risk and compliance, and facility management. The core of Basico’s business is its 
extensive experience in operating and managing support functions in both Denmark and 
abroad.   
 

http://www.enablesoft.com/
http://www.basico.dk/
http://www.basico.dk/


 
About EnableSoft  
As an early innovator in the Robotic Process Automation space, Orlando, Florida-based 
EnableSoft Inc. has helped organizations save time, save money, and improve productivity. 
Serving over 500 corporate clients worldwide, EnableSoft develops and markets Foxtrot®, 
software that eliminates the burden of manual data processes by behaving, deciding and 
working just like a person.   
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